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A practical guide to getting personal investing right

Somewhere along the way, something has gone very wrong with the way individuals save and invest. Too
often, households are drawn in by promotional suggestions masquerading as impartial investment advice.
Consumers get saddled with more risk than they realize. Authors Zvi Bodie and Rachelle Taqqu understand
the dilemma that today's investors face, and with Risk Less and Prosper they will help you find your
financial footing.

Written in an accessible style, this practical guide skillfully explains why personal investing is all about
you—your goals, your values and your career path. It shows how to understand investment risk and choose
the particular blend of risk and safety that is right for you. And it lays out several simple yet powerful ways
for small investors to cast a reliable safety net to achieve their financial goals and truly prosper. Coauthors
Bodie and Taqqu challenge the myth that all investments require risk, then highlight some important risks
that families often disregard when deciding where to put their money. Later, they connect the dots between
investment and investor, showing us all how to grasp our own investment risk profiles and how we may use
these insights to make more fitting investment choices.

Outlines a straightforward way to invest by aligning your investments with your goals and the risk levels●

you can bear
Provides basic investment abc's for readers who are otherwise literate●

Lays out a simple, actionable plan for achieving your goals●

Explains the role of risk-free assets and investment insurance in assuring that you reach your most essential●

goals

Contrary to popular belief, investing doesn't have to be complicated. You can build wealth without taking
great risks. Risk Less and Prosper will show you how to make investment decisions that will make your
financial life less stressful and more profitable.
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From reader reviews:

Robert Aviles:

With other case, little persons like to read book Risk Less and Prosper: Your Guide to Safer Investing. You
can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a
new book Risk Less and Prosper: Your Guide to Safer Investing. You can add understanding and of course
you can around the world by just a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can know
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple point until
wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we could open a book as well as searching by internet
system. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored to go to the library. Let's study.

Timothy Payne:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the headline Risk Less and
Prosper: Your Guide to Safer Investing suitable to you? The particular book was written by popular writer in
this era. The actual book untitled Risk Less and Prosper: Your Guide to Safer Investingis one of several
books that everyone read now. That book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this
guide you will enter the new age that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their idea in the simple
way, consequently all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this e-book. This book will give you a
lot of information about this world now. So that you can see the represented of the world on this book.

William Henslee:

The actual book Risk Less and Prosper: Your Guide to Safer Investing will bring you to the new experience
of reading some sort of book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. When you try to find new
book to read, this book very ideal to you. The book Risk Less and Prosper: Your Guide to Safer Investing is
much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can
more readily to read the book.

Cindy Mattis:

Reading a guide make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of news. Within this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone. From media social just like
newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just looking for the Risk
Less and Prosper: Your Guide to Safer Investing when you desired it?
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