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This book is dedicated to fundamentals of a new theory, which is an analog of affine algebraic geometry for
(nonlinear) partial differential equations. This theory grew up from the classical geometry of PDE's
originated by S. Lie and his followers by incorporating some nonclassical ideas from the theory of integrable
systems, the formal theory of PDE's in its modern cohomological form given by D. Spencer and H.
Goldschmidt and differential calculus over commutative algebras (Primary Calculus). The main result of this
synthesis is Secondary Calculus on diffieties, new geometrical objects which are analogs of algebraic
varieties in the context of (nonlinear) PDE's. Secondary Calculus surprisingly reveals a deep cohomological
nature of the general theory of PDE's and indicates new directions of its further progress. Recent
developments in quantum field theory showed Secondary Calculus to be its natural language, promising a
nonperturbative formulation of the theory. In addition to PDE's themselves, the author describes existing and
potential applications of Secondary Calculus ranging from algebraic geometry to field theory, classical and
quantum, including areas such as characteristic classes, differential invariants, theory of geometric structures,
variational calculus, control theory, etc. This book, focused mainly on theoretical aspects, forms a natural
dipole with Symmetries and Conservation Laws for Differential Equations of Mathematical Physics, Volume
182 in this same series, Translations of Mathematical Monographs, and shows the theory ""in action"".
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From reader reviews:

Gena Colgan:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the
book that improve your knowledge and information. The info you get based on what kind of reserve you
read, if you want attract knowledge just go with education books but if you want really feel happy read one
along with theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The actual Cohomological Analysis of Partial
Differential Equations and Secondary Calculus (Translations of Mathematical Monographs) is kind of book
which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Maureen Daniels:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you already been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Cohomological Analysis of Partial
Differential Equations and Secondary Calculus (Translations of Mathematical Monographs), it is possible to
enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh come
on its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Mary Ponce:

Reading a book to become new life style in this yr; every people loves to learn a book. When you study a
book you can get a lots of benefit. When you read publications, you can improve your knowledge, mainly
because book has a lot of information onto it. The information that you will get depend on what types of
book that you have read. In order to get information about your research, you can read education books, but
if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, these us novel, comics, as well as
soon. The Cohomological Analysis of Partial Differential Equations and Secondary Calculus (Translations of
Mathematical Monographs) provide you with a new experience in looking at a book.

Carol Reck:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is written or printed or descriptive from each source this filled update of news.
Within this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social such as newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, story and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out
your book? Or just searching for the Cohomological Analysis of Partial Differential Equations and
Secondary Calculus (Translations of Mathematical Monographs) when you needed it?
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