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Tucked away in London's edgy Soho district, Polpo is one of the most irrepressibly buzzing restaurants in
town. Critics and food aficionados have been flocking to this understated bacaro where Russell Norman
serves up small dishes-think tapas-from the back streets of Venice. A far cry from the tourist-trap eateries of
the famous floating city, this kind of cooking is unfussy, innovative, and exuberantly delicious. The 120
recipes in this book range from salads and snacks to small main courses, drinks, and desserts, including
asparagus with Parmesan and anchovy butter; warm duck salad with beets and walnuts; crispy baby pizzas
with zucchini, mint and chilli; scallops with lemon and peppermint; soft-shell crab in Parmesan batter with
fennel; fizzy bellinis and glasses of bright orange spritz; panacotta with poached rhubarb; and warm autumn
fruits with amaretto cream.

The recipes are accompanied by luminescent photography within a dazzling design, including a distinctive
stripped-away spine to reveal colorful Japanese stitching--a feature that also allows the book to lie open flat
on a chef's workstation. Polpo captures the unfrequented corners, bustling bacari, and sublime waterways of
Venice as they've never been seen before.
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From reader reviews:

Bryant Kelly:

With other case, little persons like to read book POLPO: A Venetian Cookbook (Of Sorts). You can choose
the best book if you love reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of book
POLPO: A Venetian Cookbook (Of Sorts). You can add know-how and of course you can around the world
by way of a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can understand everything! From your
country until foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple point until wonderful thing it is
possible to know that. In this era, we could open a book as well as searching by internet unit. It is called e-
book. You can utilize it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's learn.

Gary Wilson:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that
that book is very important normally. The book POLPO: A Venetian Cookbook (Of Sorts) was making you
to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is rather advantages for you.
The reserve POLPO: A Venetian Cookbook (Of Sorts) is not only giving you a lot more new information but
also to get your friend when you experience bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your
book. Try to make relationship with the book POLPO: A Venetian Cookbook (Of Sorts). You never sense
lose out for everything should you read some books.

Charles Wagoner:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a while
is reading. Yep, by reading a publication your ability to survive enhance then having chance to stand than
other is high. For yourself who want to start reading any book, we give you this kind of POLPO: A Venetian
Cookbook (Of Sorts) book as nice and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is greater than just a
book.

James Fitzpatrick:

As people who live in often the modest era should be update about what going on or data even knowledge to
make them keep up with the era that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe can update
themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for you personally but the problems coming to a person is
you don't know what kind you should start with. This POLPO: A Venetian Cookbook (Of Sorts) is our
recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need in
this era.
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