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Grab your beach towel and sunblock and prepare to take a comical and enthralling journey that transports
you from the raunchy playgrounds of South Beach and St. Tropez to the sophisticated romance and beauty of
Napa Valley and Paris. Welcome to the world of Valerie Sutherland, former Gucci Girl and future Parisian
mistress. After having her heart broken by a charming, young vintner and dealing with one too many of her
spoiled clients at Gucci, Valerie decides that it is high-time to exit retail hell. In an attempt to keep up with
girlfriends Bianca, a serial bride from Brazil, and Jen, a trust-fund aided socialite, Valerie heads off for the
South of France where she experiences wild parties, world-class shopping sprees, luxury yachts and sexy
European men. As a kept-woman with no future plans for a career, it isn’t until the party ends that Valerie is
faced with the dilemma of how to maintain her new found lifestyle on her own. She soon learns that life as a
mistress isn’t all it’s cracked up to be and when a near fashion fiasco threatens Valerie’s ability to attend a
party, an unknown talent as a fashion designer is unearthed.
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From reader reviews:

George Thomas:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the spare time or they will get
great deal of stress from both way of life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not just a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you have
when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you ever try this
one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have read is
usually Gucci Girl.

Kirk Banks:

Gucci Girl can be one of your beginner books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away
because this publication has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in terminology, easy to
understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The copy writer giving his/her effort to get
every word into joy arrangement in writing Gucci Girl but doesn't forget the main position, giving the reader
the hottest as well as based confirm resource info that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great
information can certainly drawn you into new stage of crucial thinking.

Michele Williams:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray an individual, why because this Gucci Girl guide written by well-
known writer whose to say well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who else read the
book. Written throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate
your hunger then you still skepticism Gucci Girl as good book not simply by the cover but also by the
content. This is one guide that can break don't evaluate book by its handle, so do you still needing yet
another sixth sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your reading sixth sense already alerted you so why
you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Lisa Williams:

Is it you actually who having spare time in that case spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This Gucci Girl can be the solution, oh
how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this
brand new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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